Town of Aurora
Building Department

Memo W2

To: Town Board
From: Patrick Blizniak
CC: Ron Bennett
Date: August 13, 2013
Re: Gleed shed

The existing shed (behind Gleed warehouse) that houses our snow blower, gasoling, weed eaters,
garden tools and miscellaneous items inappropriate for warehouse storage (Due to cost of ramp), is in
disrepair and unsecure. | received four quotes that included delivery and setup. The following are the
quotes | received and my recommendation for the purchase of a 10 X 12 shed goes to Heritage
struciures at the low bid price of $1999.00. If this meets your approval, the placement on the 20" of

August Town Board work session would be appreciated.

Heritage Structures, (585) 798-2016; $1999

84 Lumber, Doug Gray, (877) 462-8484 $2099

Star Construction Sheds, (Fox Furniture) $3139

AAA Race Storage Sheds (716) 566-8254 $4000
hank You

7
ick Blizfiak



10X12 gable shed with gable entrance, no windows
Price includes delivery and erection

Heritage Structures, (585) 798-2016; $1999
84 Lumber, Doug Gray, (877) 462-8484  $2099
Star Construction Sheds, (Fox Furniture) $3139

AAA Race Storage Sheds (716) 566-8254  $4000



Heritage Structures™
Ceate { Order Form

Custorer Name: ;?3“"“" 0’1[ ﬁbuln‘mﬁ ' ikdal Pty cj{' Datla'._j_h /87743

Address: Phone:

City:_, St Zip: Approx. Del. Datar

Directuns, Delivery Notea:_

g{ b

| Bidg. Size JO wxL {2 Rowd Celor: Vent, Windows & Drip Edge Color, O Brawn T3 Whits
! Ganle Cotiage ¢ waty (3 Gable Storage Garage (rwat 13 Quaker gwalt (3 Horse Bam vweny [ Chalet 6 wan
! l 07 Cabinwwai; 13 Gable end porch 1 Eave side parch

: {1 Gambrel Sivle Garags (6 wall) 9 Gambyel Loft Bam (& wali 3 Othier

¥ Trewted Plywcad 12700 treaded

Floor Type Lo ;J"’ 1§Fv

Siding: 03 Pine Board & Batten

3 Vinyl Biding and Comer Post Color __TrimColos:_ Shutter Cotor:

Luifel Lap is standard for vinyl sided eheds with Louvared siyle shulte=s: 71 Chack ivars for Traditicnat Lap {claphoard style)
7 Check here for Raised Panel 3tyle Shutters

'ﬂ’Smartside, pre-primed pamt Option to paint: (Trim Coler:______ RBidg. Color }
3 Buraterp, unprimed Trim Caolor:
O Kit Form: a3 MNO flsor
Options adder; [='"O- C.wally & Roof ¢ D wenntw ¥
' Doable Peapy 5 g
AR VRNV &+ g g
5 Trowded F F,‘r’;'l’:?-wﬁ £ $
Window and door locations e-a Viaw) ! Pase Price: $‘“im
Mistakss on tbis‘carbgnfesag farm can aot be corrented, Del. & Sat-up* 3_&_::¢. ek '\“""’"I “ka
Rlpage sketzit your cholces on serap paper firsl, A ey
' 2. options Total:  §__tn e.lucoke of
Subiotal: $
fol......... RoofLine . . \ Deductions: -8
Aeritiew 4 suototar  =5__ 19T
Sales Tax ‘ S___g—_"f_""“'f’ +
Hauling Positinn; Laad dwor te the following position for delivery, Total: % E_‘lie
[icas [rea [rassanger 8e [ Driver Side Deposit: -5 i)
Balance Dus:  §_ __CoD.
Customer Signature: Date: "See terma & conditions on reverse,

T - 68T TN
oy WL 65307

Jpar

pd SLOZUBLGRS s@innne elbeiisy BZLLLELGLIND



RE: quote - Yahoo! Mail Page 1 of 2

VAFIOOL, MAIL

Caugie

RE: guote Friday, July 5, 2013 5:58 AM |
From: "Doug Gray" <Doug.Gray@84lumber.biz>
To: "Bliz" <patbliz@yahoo.com>

Pat,
Installation would be additional 582-5,00 '
Thank you,

Doug Gray

[Internet Sales Manager| 84 LumBer Company | grayd@84lumber.com|Mon-Frl 7AM - 5PM

|1019 Route 519, BuiLDInG 3, E1GHTY Four, PA 15330|ToLL FRee 877-462-8484 /P 724.228.8820
x1146|F 877.213.3599|

Shop Now at www.84lumber.com

From: Bliz {mailto:patbliz@yahoo.com]
Sent: Thursday, July 4, 2013 8:41 AM
To: Doug Gray

Subject: Re: quote

Doug,
[ assume this is materials only. Do you have someone to erect also and how much?

Pat

“Life is not a journey fo the grave with the intention of arriving
safely in a pretty and well-preserved body but rather to skid in
broadside, thoroughly used up, totally worn out, and loudly
proclaiming, WOW! What a ride!"
http:/f'www.hypnosisbypat.com

1914

<
--- On Thu, 7/4/13, Doug Gray <Doug.Gray@84lumber.biz> wrote: 09§ ,

a ~
From: Doug Gray <Doug.Gray(@84lumber.biz> j ﬂs,,@[/gf?’ﬁ g
Subject: quote
To: "'patbliz(@yahoo.com" <patbliz(@yahoo.com> L[
Date: Thursday, July 4, 2013, 8:35 AM 9:0
Patrick,
Attached is the quote you requested if you have any questions or changes please let me know.

http://us.mc1610.mail.yahoo.com/me/showMessage 7sMid=11&filterBy=&.rand=70881699&midIndex=11&mid... 7/5/2013



STIMATE #439 84 LUMBER CO.

/04/13 8§:12 AMm PAGE 2
ME : PATRICK BLIZNIAK STORE: 0632 - ELMA
DE : ADDRESS: 6061 SENECA ST ELMA NY 14059
DRESS: 300 GLEED AVE PHONE : (716) 652-8462
EAST AURORA, NY 14052 ASSOCTIATE: DOUG GRAY (WEB SALES)

ONE: (716} 652-7591 FAX: EST DATE: 07/04/13 START: /7
OJECT:
THIS IS NOT A RECEIPT > #439 CUSTOMER COPY

P.O.S.# DE;CRIPTIOQ _______________________________________________
0. 2278400 COBRA 20" ROLL VENT
1. 4041206 4X4X12 SYP TREATED #2

END OF PACKAGE: 8370899

4, 30000 DELIVERY SERVICE

SUBTOTAL  :$1,274.00
TAX T $111.48
TOTAL $1,385.48

84 LUMBER CO. ESTIMATE AND PRICING POLICY

REGULAR UNIT PRICES ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGE WITHOUT NOTICE ANYTIME AFTER 7 DAYS FOLLOWING DATE OF ESTIMATE.

SALE PRICES ARE IN EFFECT ONLY UNTIL THE END OF THE ADVERTISED SALE PERICD.

CUSTOMER DEPOSIT OF FULL AMOUNT OF ESTIMATED TOTAL PRICE WILL RENDER UNIT PRICES FIRM FOR 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF DEPOSIT.

84 LUMBER CO. ASSUMES NO RESPONSIBILITY FOR ACCURACY OF TAKE OFFS FROM DRAWINGS OR BLUEPRINTS OR THAT THE PRODUCTS LISTED WILL BE
SUFFICIENT TO COMPLETE CUSTOMER'S INTENDED PROJECT. CUSTOMERS $HOULD HAVE QUALIFIED ENGINEER OR ARCHITECT REVIEW ALL QUANTITIES.
THIS ESTIMATE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT OF SALE OR GUARANTEE AVAILABILITY OF ANY PRODUCT LISTED.

ALL PRICES QUOTED BASED ON TOTAL PACKAGE PRICE AND SUBJECT TO CHANGE IF TOTAL PACKAGE NOT PURCHASED OR CONTENTS OF PACKAGE CHANGE.

r this project, call Maggie's Management LLC for a quote on Builders Risk
surance from zurich (located in Jacksonville FL). 800-664-1984 x2108, 2165, 2107

ggies Management, LLC is a Ticensed insurance producer and is a separate entity from
Lumber Co. 84 Lumber Co. is not Ticensed to and does not sell insurance.



Amish sheds in Buffalo, NY | Buffalo Amish sheds - YP.com Page 1 of 2

White Pages | Mobile Apps | Advertise with Us About Us | We're Hiring! ProSaiect | Signin | Join

Amish Sheds insar | Buffalo, NY

Amish sheds in Buffalo, NY Resuts 1-9cf9

| ListView Niap View |

Sponsored Links

Amish Sheds Buffale MY - Shop411.com

shopd11 com;Amish+Sheds+Buffalo+NY Search for Amish Sheds Buffalo NY. Find Low Prices and
Great Valus.

13 GMC YUKDN DENA
Amish-made Garden Bidgs - Charming, functional, customized

vwww.homeplasestructures.com/ Online catalog/pricing. Nationwide. AFR i i Wuadt N

o
Reqguest Your Free Gatalog  Studlo Gardan Buildings é) GU niLl;FiE;J au !ER gx CUBTOMER CASH
Gerden Chalet Buildings Choosing the Hight Garden Buliding -

Amish Sheds Butfalo MY - shetds WehCrawler.Com
sheds.weberewler.com/ Search for Amish Sheds Buffalo YWitW OF Results at WebCrawiar

" ey Tk
WNE Bun dnalit
:s st "\A‘i& s g e

1 AAA Race Storage Sheds P 7.2 miles
3181 Abbott Rd, Orchard Park, Y 14127 > ¥ap '
(716) 566-8254 Featured Sheds in Buffalo, NY
» Webslte » More Info > Add Photes
What: Sheds, Slurage Heusehield & Commercial, Selt Sioage @r FACTCRY DIRECT STEEL BUILDINGS-SAVE
UP TO 680% OFF SELECT OVERSTOCK
BUILDINGS
2 Siurdi Built Sheds 13 5 ms\es Serving the Buffalc Area.
6341 Lakemant Ct, East Amnerst, NY 14051 » Map Be tha first 1o review (888) 976-5671

What: Sheds, Public & Conunercial Watshouses % /\? - - /:Qy/ 3 » Wabsite » More Info
e e e e et e C:w 5 s, POWETB Steel Buildings, Ine.
Setving the Bulfalo Aree.

(T16) AD6-2291 ’g . Enlarge Sustainable Steet Bulldings
» Maore Infa > Add Photos a’qﬁ f ‘ With 50 YR Warranty

3 Crehard Parks & Gardens 8.9 miles (877} 515-1928
2024 Southwastarn Bivd, Orchard Park, NY 14127 » Map B3 tha first to review . Staet Buildings Manufactured
(718) 6758055 SAFEWAY 10 k1 vour Needs
» More Info  » Add Photos -
- Enlarge
What: Sheds
» Wabsite = Mare info
4 Fox's Lawn Furniture 13 miles
7570 Seneca B, East Aurora, NY 14052 » Map o Be the first to review
(716) 652-3800 ¢
» Website > More Info > Add Photas :5%

What: Sheds, Fumiture Stores, Public & Commercial Warehousas

& Sun Enterprises 12.6 miles

636 Erie 51, Lancaster, MY 14086  » Map Be the first 1o raview
{116} a32-4748

» Website > More info » Add Pholos
Wial: Sheds, General Contractors

B Siore-Park of Western New York 25 miies

800 Blairvile Rd, Youngstown, NY 14174 » Map Be the first to raview
{716} 745-3780

» More Inio  » Add Photos
What: Shads

7 The Home Depot 135)
Serving the Buffalo Area.
{866) 394-6038

» Wehslie » More info
Whal Sheds, Tool & Utifity Sheds. Soreen Enclosures

8 PowerBiit Steel Bulidings, Inc, (22}
Serving the Buffalo Area.
{877) 515-1926

» Website = More info > Add Photos
What: Sheds, Metal Buildings, Buildings-Pre-Cut, Prefabricated & Modular

http://www.yellowpages.com/buffalo-ny/amish-sheds7from=SEMPS_GGI. Search acct=Branding_Dynamica... 5/24/2013



Sheds, Cottage Shed, Gable Shed, Carriage Shed, Barn Shed - Fox Lawn Furniture East Aurora NY Page 1 0f 15

Home ‘ /
About Us
Products

Price List
Contact

Porch Swings & Gliders | Chairs | Benches | Picnic Tables | Arbors & Bridges | Other Products |
Sheds

STAR CONSTRUCTION SHEDS

/5 Bl /ool

Cottage With Half Porch L

s s
VINYL SIDED
HEMLOCK B&B
SMART SIDE

DESCRIPTION

$4,149
$3,649
$3,149
10x12x9
$4,399
$3,879
$3,349

10x14x9

hitp:/fwww foxslawnfurniture.com/sheds.php 7/3/2013



Jolene Jeffe

From: Peggy Cooke

Sent: Monday, July 15, 2013 1:06 PM

To: Jolene Jeffe w S‘ .
Subject: FW: Friends Board Class of 2013

Hi Jo-

According to the email below, my term on the Friends of Knox Park Board of Directors will end on October 3", would
you or another member of the Town Board like to serve on this board as the Town Representative? If not, | will
continue to serve.

Thanks, Peggy

From: Paul Battaglia [mailto: pbattaglia434@gmail.com]
Sent: Saturday, July 13, 2013 4:29 PM
To: Pegqgy Cooke; Ryan Erwin; William F. Patterson; eliizathrash@yahoo.com; paige.wettlaufer@agmail.com; Elizabeth
ODONNELL; Seymour H. Knox IV (SHKIV@aol.com)
Cc: Elizabeth Wallace; CampMead@aol.com Hatcher
Subject: Friends Board Class of 2013

Members of the Class of 2013:

Your term on the Board of Directors will end at the Annual Meeting of the Members which will be held on
October 3, 2013. Under the provisions of the Corporation's By-Laws (Article V, Section 2), you are eligible to
serve another term on the Board.

The Governance Committee will be meeting soon to consider the nominations to be presented to the members at
the Membership Meeting. (The nomination procedure is sct out in Article VIII, Section 2(b), of the By-

Laws.) The purpose of this email is to determine whether you would like to be considered for nomination for
another term..

Please respond to this email as soon as possible so that the Governance Committee will know your wishes at its
upcoming meeting, Please feel free to contact me or any other member of the Committee should you have any
questions regarding this matter.

Regards.

Paul



SUPERVISOR
JOLENE M. JEFFE
(716) 652-7590

ijeffe@townofaurora.com

‘l‘l""‘ Ttiun:hf TOWN CLERK
AUFora MARTHA L. LIBROCK
T 3280

' tov ~com

TOWN COUNCIL MEMBERS

Jeffrey T. Harris
iharris@townofaurora.com

James F. Collins
jcollins@townofaurora.com

James J. Bach
ibach@towncfaurora.com

Susan A. Friess
sfriess@towncfaurora.com

SUPT. OF HIGHWAYS
David M. Gunner

kY

: (716) 652-4050
highway@townofaurora.com
RECEIVER OF TAXES
Barbara Halt

(716) 652-7596

tax@townofaurora.com

SUPT. OF BUILDING
Patrick J. Blizniak

(716) 652-7591
building@townofaurora.com
ASSESSOR
Thelma Homberger
assessor@townofaurora.com
(716) 652-0011

DIR. OF RECREATION
Peggy M. Cooke

(716) 652-8866
pegay@townofaurcra.com

TOWN ATTORNEY
Ronald P. Bennett

TOWN JUSTICE
Douglas W. Marky
Jeffrey P. Markello

HISTORIAN

Robert L. Goller

(716) 652-7944
historian@townofaurora.com

FAX: (716) 652-3507

TDD (716) 714-1001
For the Hearing Impaired

“Dyvid

TOWN OF AURORA wes- <
5 South Grove Street, East Aurora, NY 14052

www.townofaurora.com

August 2, 2013
To: Town Board Members

I respectfully request that the Town Board approve taking $2,500 out of
Contingent Account A 1990 and putting it into part time dog control A 3510.101.
Part time dog control was budgeted for $7,000 in 2012. In 2013 the amount was
reduced to $5,000. We have already reached that amount this year and there is not
going to be enough money to pay our part time Doc Control Officer for the rest of
the year. The good news is that revenue has been stronger than anticipated this
year and it should offset this amount. We believe this will allow us to continue
Dog Control services after hours for the rest of the year.

"M Gunner
Superintendent of Highways



Budget Transfer Request Form

All budget transfers must be submitted to the Supervisor’s Office using this form. Budget transfers
should be made PRIOR to the expenditure. By law, individual budget lines should never go negative.
Although occasional, unplanned overages cannot be avoided, such occurrences should be rare.

The required approval will be obtained by the Supervisor’s Office.

Please note the following guidelines:

« A shortage of less than $750 per line can be satisfied with this form requesting a budget transfer(s)
between lines that are within the responsibility of a single Department Head. These will require the
approval of the Supervisor.

o A shortage bf $750 or more per line can be satisfied with this form requesting a 'budget transfer(s)
between lines that are within the responsibility of a single Departiment Head. These will require the
approval of the Town Board. '

« A shortage of any amount can be satisfied with this form requesting a budget transfer(s) between
lines which fall under the responsibility of different Department Heads. These will require the
approval of the Town Board.

Departmént Head igted): BQ Uy CQ éL)\!\ Nev-
Signature: -l Date: X, /-2,,//

Iam requestingw%g budget transfer(s):

. (Amount) | 88  From (account number) A 3510- A4S
To: (account number) /T D510 4[5 |
Redson: _|*0\land \<eanel Cost 4 Cosk Lo shuy doy GOF Cag-f
2. (Amount) SYO  From (;.ccount mmbery A 3SIOMIT bl (40,
To: (account number) __ A 35O Y15 |
Reason:_olland Yennel ppar ¢ Cost for vy clog et Cavly .

3. (Amount) | From (account number)

Gk M\Q

To: (account number)

Reason:

Approvals:

Supervisor Signature: _ Date:

Town Board Approval Required: Action # Date:

Transfer Complete: Date:
(Book keeper initials)

C\Documents and Settings\jjeffe\My Documents\Supervisor\Budget Transfer Request Form.doc



TOWN OF AURORA
LOCAL LAW INTRO. NO. __ -2013 [/U Y -G

LOCALLAW _ -2013

A LOCAL LAW, TO AMEND LOCAL LAW 1-1990 KNOWN AS “THE CODES OF
THE TOWN OF AURORA”, ADOPTED BY THE TOWN BOARD OF THE TOWN OF

AURORA ON JANUARY 22, 1990, BY AMENDING CHAPTER 113 REGARDING

BE IT ENACTED BY THE TOWN BOARD OF THE TOWN OF AURORA AS

FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. LEGISLATIVE INTENT

This Local Law amends a prior Local Law known as “The Town of Aurora Code”
adopted by the Town of Aurora on January 22, 1990, as amended, relating to the administrative,

legislative and general legislation of Codes within the Town of Aurora as therein set forth..

SECTION 2. SECTION 113-34, BILLING PROCEDURE; PENALTY FOR LATE

PAYMENTS
Section 116-34 is amended to read as follows:
Checks for payments of water district bills and water charges shall be
made payable to the water district. Meters will be read and bills rendered at
regular quarterly intervals. Bills for the previous quarter shall be due and payable

at the office and on the date designated on the bill. Unpaid water charges,



including charges to out-of-district users, in arrears for 30 days or longer shall be
subject to a penalty not exceeding 10% of the amount due, and the Water
Department and/or Erie County Water Authority may cut off the supply of water
if such water charges are not paid within 60 days of the date due. The Town
Board may, by rules and regulations, provide for an additional charge for

restoring the service of water in addition to the unpaid water bill.

SECTION 3. EFFECTIVE DATE

This Local Law shall take effect immediately upon filing with the New York Secretary of

State.



